
LAUDERDALE COUNTY BOARD OF SUPERVISORS – 2023 1st 6-MONTHS TERM BID OPENING RESULTS 
TOTAL BIDS SUBMITTED: 1 

 

BID NO. 3931 – CONCRETE PIPES 

 

DESIGN PRECAST & PIPE, INC. 
GULFPORT, MS 

FINAL BID 
 
 

 
 

CLASS III REINFORCED  
CONCRETE PIPES 

 

FLARED END SECTIONS FOR CLASS III 
REINFORCED CONCRETE PIPES 
 

 SIZE PRICE PER FT. PRICE EACH 
 
12" 

$25.20 NO BID  

 
 
15" 

$25.20 $628.60 
 
18" 

$34.56 $808.20 
 
24" 

$52.92 $1,161.60 
 
30" 

$76.32 $1,630.00 
 
36" 

$99.00 $2,275.00 
 
42" 

$123.48 $3,170.00 
 
48" 

$156.24 $3,410.00 
 
54" 

$192.24 $3,715.00 
 
60" 

$233.28 $4,788.20 
 
66" 

NO BID  

326.16 

NO BID 

 
 
72" 

$326.16 $6,965.00 

  DELIVERY 

 

 

 

20 DAYS 20 DAYS 

                                         
                                      CLASS III REINFORCED  

 ARCH CONCRETE PIPES 

 

 

FLARED END SECTIONS FOR CLASS III 
REINFORCED ARCH CONCRETE PIPES 

SIZE PRICE PER FT. PRICE EACH 
 
22 x 13 

$44.46 $808.20 
 
29 x 18 

$61.94 $1,161.60 
 
36 x 23 

$74.48 $1,630.00 
 
44 x 27 

$102.22 $2,275.00 
 
51 x 31 

$132.24 $2,740.00 
 
58 x 36 

$168.34 $3,410.00 
 
65 x 40 

$205.20 NO BID 

 DELIVERY 

 
 

20 DAYS 20 DAYS 

  

BITUMINOUS JOINT CEMENT FOR ABOVE:  __________________________  $__________ PER GAL. 

 


