LAUDERDALE COUNTY BOARD OF SUPERVISORS — 2023 1** 6-MONTHS TERM BID OPENING RESULTS
TOTAL BIDS SUBMITTED: 2

BID NO: 3936 ROAD STRIPING

McCRANEY

TRAFFIC CONTROL

STRIPING & SEAL PRODUCTS
LUCEDALE, MS PEARL, MS
Item Description for Bid FINAL BID FINAL BID
White/Yellow 4” Continuous Center Line Thermoplastic S 0.45 LF $3,977.00 PM / $0.75 LF
White/Yellow 4” Continuous Skip Line Thermoplastic S0.30 LF $1,977.00 PM / $0.37 LF
White/Yellow 4” Continuous Edge Line Thermoplastic S 0.40 LF $3,477.00 PM / $0.66 LF
Thermoplastic Pavement Marking - Word $400.00 EA NO BID
Thermoplastic Pavement Marking - Arrow $99.00 EA NO BID
Thermoplastic Pavement Marking - Railroad Emblem $1,200.00 EA NO BID
Thermoplastic Pavement Marking - 12” $6.00 LF NO BID
Thermoplastic Pavement Marking - 24” $12.00 LF NO BID
Raised Pavement Markers S5.50 EA $10.00 EA




