
LAUDERDALE COUNTY BOARD OF SUPERVISORS – 2023 2nd 6-MONTHS TERM BID OPENING RESULTS 
TOTAL BIDS SUBMITTED: 1 

 

BID NO. 3948 – CONCRETE PIPES 

 

DESIGN PRECAST & PIPE, INC. 
GULFPORT, MS 

FINAL BID 
 
 

 
 

CLASS III REINFORCED  
CONCRETE PIPES 

 

FLARED END SECTIONS FOR CLASS III 
REINFORCED CONCRETE PIPES 
 

 SIZE PRICE PER FT. PRICE EACH 
 
12" 

$23.80 NO BID  

 
 
15" 

$23.80 $700.00 
 
18" 

$32.64 $900.00 
 
24" 

$49.98 $1,300.00 
 
30" 

$72.08 $1,800.00 
 
36" 

$93.50 $2,500.00 
 
42" 

$116.62 NO BID 
 
48" 

$147.56 $3,800.00 
 
54" 

$181.56 NO BID 
 
60" 

$220.32 NO BID 
 
66" 

NO BID  

326.16 

NO BID 

 
 
72" 

$308.04 $7,420.00 

  DELIVERY 

 

 

 

15 DAYS 15 DAYS 

                                         
                                      CLASS III REINFORCED  

 ARCH CONCRETE PIPES 

 

 

FLARED END SECTIONS FOR CLASS III 
REINFORCED ARCH CONCRETE PIPES 

SIZE PRICE PER FT. PRICE EACH 
 
22 x 13 

$43.29 $900.00 
 
29 x 18 

$60.31 $1,300.00 
 
36 x 23 

$72.52 $1,800.00 
 
44 x 27 

$99.53 $2,500.00 
 
51 x 31 

$128.76 $3,120.00 
 
58 x 36 

$163.91 $3,800.00 
 
65 x 40 

$199.80 NO BID 

 DELIVERY 

 
 

15 DAYS 15DAYS 

  

BITUMINOUS JOINT CEMENT FOR ABOVE:  __________________________  $__________ PER GAL. 

 


