
LAUDERDALE COUNTY BOARD OF SUPERVISORS – 2023 2nd 6-MONTHS TERM BID OPENING RESULTS - TOTAL BIDS SUBMITTED: 4 
 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

BID NO: 3949 HDPE 
Corrugated Plastic Pipe ; 
Diameter sizes: 12” - 36” 
HDPE Corrugated Plastic 
Pipe  - Item for Bid 

 
FERGUSON 

WATERWORKS 
GULFPORT, MS 

FINAL BID 

 
J & G CULVERTS 

 
FAYETTE, AL 
FINAL BID 

 
G & O SUPPLY 

 
TUPELO, MS 
FINAL BID 

 
SOUTHERN PIPE & 

SUPPLY 
RICHLAND, MS 

FINAL BID 
 

Corrugated Pipe 12" $8.09 $7.75 $8.09 $8.09 

Corrugated Pipe 15" $11.63 $10.60 $11.63 $11.63 

Corrugated Pipe 18" $15.68 $14.82 $15.68 $15.68 

Corrugated Pipe 20" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Corrugated Pipe 24" $29.86 $25.41 $29.86 $29.86 

Corrugated Pipe 30" $39.98 $35.84 $39.98 $39.98 

Corrugated Pipe 36" $58.21 $43.27 $58.21 $58.21 

Corr.Coupling 12" $9.78 $9.30 $9.78 $9.78 

Corr.Coupling 15" $16.30 $19.90 $16.30 $16.30 

Corr.Coupling 18" $27.77 $57.69 $27.77 $27.77 

Corr.Coupling 20" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Corr.Coupling 24" $39.17 $65.36 $39.17 $39.17 

Corr.Coupling 30" $91.05 $108.79 $91.05 $91.05 

Corr.Coupling 36" $126.68 $226.86 $126.68 $126.68 

Smooth Inter. Pipe 12" $8.09 $7.25 $8.09 $8.09 

Smooth Inter. Pipe 15" $11.63 $9.55 $11.63 $11.63 

Smooth Inter. Pipe 18" $15.68 $14.00 $15.68 $15.68 

Smooth Inter. Pipe 20" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Smooth Inter. Pipe 24" $29.86 $22.78 $29.86 $29.86 

Smooth Inter. Pipe 30" $39.98 $31.83 $39.98 $39.98 

Smooth Inter. Pipe 36" $58.21 $37.27 $58.21 $58.21 

Smooth Inter.Coupling 12" $9.78 $10.30 $9.78 $9.78 

Smooth Inter.Coupling 15" $16.30 $20.90 $16.30 $16.30 

Smooth Inter.Coupling 18" $27.77 $57.69 $27.77 $27.77 

Smooth Inter.Coupling 20" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Smooth Inter.Coupling 24" $39.17 $65.36 $39.17 $39.17 

Smooth Inter.Coupling 30" $91.05 $108.79 $91.05 $91.05 

Smooth Inter.Coupling 36" $126.68 $226.86 $126.68 $126.68 



LAUDERDALE COUNTY BOARD OF SUPERVISORS – 2023 2nd 6-MONTHS TERM BID OPENING RESULTS - TOTAL BIDS SUBMITTED: 4 
 
 

 

 

BID NO: 3949 PROPOSAL #2 
High Performance (HP) 
Polypropylene Storm Pipes 
Diameter sizes: 12” - 60”     
Item for Bid 

 
FERGUSON 

WATERWORKS 
GULFPORT, MS 

FINAL BID 

 
J & G CULVERTS 

FAYETTE, AL 
FINAL BID  

Bid is for Alternate 
Material 

 
G & O SUPPLY 

 
TUPELO, MS 

FINAL BID 

 
SOUTHERN PIPE & 

SUPPLY 
RICHLAND, MS 

FINAL BID 
 

HP Pipe 12" $13.21 $11.44 $13.21 $13.21 

HP Pipe 15" $16.51 $18.20 $16.51 $16.51 

HP Pipe 18" $23.11 $25.86 $23.11 $23.11 

HP Pipe 24" $33.02 $46.92 $33.02 $33.02 

HP Pipe 30" $50.63 $67.22 $50.63 $50.63 

HP Pipe 36" $69.33 $95.56 $69.33 $69.33 

HP Pipe 42" $85.84 No Bid $85.84 $85.84 

HP Pipe 48" $116.66 No Bid $116.66 $116.66 

HP Pipe 60" $157.38 No Bid $157.38 $157.38 

 

 *Bid prices are for 
Contech H-2000 

PVC Pipe, as 
alternate to HPP 

Storm Pipe 

  


