
LAUDERDALE COUNTY BOARD OF SUPERVISORS – 2023 2nd 6-MONTHS TERM BID OPENING RESULTS  
TOTAL BIDS SUBMITTED: 3 

 

 

ADDITIONAL MATERIALS: TOTAL BIDS SUBMITTED: 1 

 VULCAN MATERIALS 
LAUREL, MS 

DELTA INDUSTRIES 
MERIDIAN, MS 

GREEN DREAM INTERNATIONAL 
COLUMBUS, MS SIEVE 

SIZE 
Percent 
Passing by 
Weight 

Size ¾ inch 
and < 

Size No. 
610 

Size No. 
825 B 

Size ¾ inch 
and < 

Size No. 
610 

Size No. 
825 B 

 
Size ¾ inch 

and < 
Size No. 

610 
Size No. 

825 B 

 Price per 
Ton 

Price per 
Ton 

Price per 
Ton 

Price per 
Ton 

Price per 
Ton 

Price 
per Ton 

Price per 
Ton 

Price per 
Ton 

Price per 
Ton 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
$43.60 

 
$43.60 

 
$43.60 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

BID NO: 3950 Gravel, Stone, Rip Rap,  
Ready-Mix Concrete 
 
Items for Bid 

VULCAN 
MATERIALS 
LAUREL, MS 
FINAL BID 

DELTA INDUSTRIES 
 

MERIDIAN, MS 
FINAL BID 

GREEN DREAM   
INTERNATIONAL 
COLUMBUS, MS 

FINAL BID 

#1 GRAVEL - per Yard No Bid No Bid No Bid 

#2 GRAVEL - per Yard No Bid No Bid No Bid 

CLAY GRAVEL (Cl.4, Gp B) - per Yard No Bid No Bid No Bid 

CLAY GRAVEL (Cl. 5, Gp B) - per Yard No Bid No Bid No Bid 

#4 STONE - per Ton $37.50 $45.00 $37.40 

#5 STONE - per Ton $37.50 No Bid No Bid 

#6 STONE - per Ton No Bid No Bid $37.40 

#7 STONE - per Ton $39.50 No Bid $37.40 

#57 STONE - per Ton $37.50 $45.00 $37.40 

#89 STONE - per Ton $39.50 No Bid $40.15 

DRY RIP RAP: SIZE 100# - per Ton $47.50 $54.00 $41.25 

DRY RIP RAP: SIZE 200# - per Ton $47.50 $54.00 $42.35 

DRY RIP RAP: SIZE 300# - per Ton $47.50 $55.00 No Bid 

DRY RIP RAP: GABION (3x3x3) - per Ton $47.50 
3X6 

No Bid $40.70 

CRUSHED LIMESTONE (Crusher Run) (#610) per Ton $36.50 $43.60 $34.65 

CRUSHED CONCRETE (Crusher Run)  
Meeting #610 Gradation 

No Bid $28.00 
When Available 

No Bid 

CONCRETE, READY-MIXED, HAULED, FOB COUNTY….    

CLASS B (3500 PSI) - PRICED PER YARD No Bid $156.50 No Bid 

CLASS C (3000 PSI) - PRICED PER YARD No Bid $151.50 No Bid 

CLASS B WITH FIBER - PRICED PER YARD No Bid $162.50 No Bid 

CLASS C WITH FIBER - PRICED PER YARD No Bid $157.50 No Bid 


