
LAUDERDALE COUNTY BOARD OF SUPERVISORS – 2024 1ST 6-MONTHS TERM BID OPENING RESULTS - TOTAL BIDS SUBMITTED: 4 
 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

BID NO: 3961 HDPE 
Corrugated Plastic Pipe ; 
Diameter sizes: 12” - 36” 
HDPE Corrugated Plastic 
Pipe  - Item for Bid 

 
SOUTHERN PIPE & 

SUPPLY 
RICHLAND, MS 

FINAL BID 
 

JWC:  EXTRA-FLOW 
PIPE & SUPPLY 
DBA: EZFLOW 
MARION, MS 

FINAL BID 

 
J & G CULVERTS 

 
FAYETTE, AL 
FINAL BID 

 
G & O SUPPLY 

 
TUPELO, MS 
FINAL BID 

Corrugated Pipe 12" $7.50 No Bid No Bid $7.50 

Corrugated Pipe 15" $9.88 No Bid No Bid $9.88 

Corrugated Pipe 18" $14.48 No Bid No Bid $14.48 

Corrugated Pipe 20" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Corrugated Pipe 24" $23.56 No Bid No Bid $23.56 

Corrugated Pipe 30" $32.92 No Bid No Bid $32.92 

Corrugated Pipe 36" $38.55 No Bid No Bid $38.55 

Corr.Coupling 12" $10.10 No Bid No Bid $10.10 

Corr.Coupling 15" $16.83 No Bid No Bid $16.83 

Corr.Coupling 18" $28.67 No Bid No Bid $28.67 

Corr.Coupling 20" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Corr.Coupling 24" $40.40 No Bid No Bid $40.40 

Corr.Coupling 30" $94.01 No Bid No Bid $94.01 

Corr.Coupling 36" $130.81 No Bid No Bid $130.81 

Smooth Inter. Pipe 12" $7.50 $8.90 $7.75 $7.50 

Smooth Inter. Pipe 15" $9.88 $11.95 $10.60 $9.88 

Smooth Inter. Pipe 18" $14.48 $17.10 $14.82 $14.48 

Smooth Inter. Pipe 20" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Smooth Inter. Pipe 24" $23.56 $23.70 $25.41 $23.56 

Smooth Inter. Pipe 30" $32.92 $38.50 $35.84 $32.92 

Smooth Inter. Pipe 36" $38.55 $53.63 $43.27 $38.55 

Smooth Inter.Coupling 12" $10.10 $25.00 $9.30 $10.10 

Smooth Inter.Coupling 15" $16.83 $33.00 $19.90 $16.83 

Smooth Inter.Coupling 18" $28.67 $52.00 $57.69 $28.67 

Smooth Inter.Coupling 20" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Smooth Inter.Coupling 24" $40.40 $75.00 $65.36 $40.40 

Smooth Inter.Coupling 30" $94.01 $140.00 $108.79 $94.01 

Smooth Inter.Coupling 36" $130.81 $260.00 $226.86 $130.81 



LAUDERDALE COUNTY BOARD OF SUPERVISORS – 2024 1ST 6-MONTHS TERM BID OPENING RESULTS - TOTAL BIDS SUBMITTED: 4 
 
 

 

 

BID NO: 3961 PROPOSAL #2 
High Performance (HP) 
Polypropylene Storm Pipes 
Diameter sizes: 12” - 60”     
Item for Bid 

 
SOUTHERN PIPE & 

SUPPLY 
RICHLAND, MS 

FINAL BID 
 

JWC:  EXTRA-FLOW 
PIPE & SUPPLY 
DBA: EZFLOW 
MARION, MS 

FINAL BID 

 
J & G CULVERTS 

 
FAYETTE, AL 
FINAL BID  

 

 
G & O SUPPLY 

 
TUPELO, MS 

FINAL BID 

HP Pipe 12" $13.64 $11.70 $14.75 $13.64 

HP Pipe 15" $17.05 $16.02 $19.50 $17.05 

HP Pipe 18" $23.86 $22.74 $24.13 $23.86 

HP Pipe 24" $34.09 $37.80 $39.45 $34.09 

HP Pipe 30" $52.27 No Bid $59.12 $52.27 

HP Pipe 36" $71.59 No Bid $67.03 $71.59 

HP Pipe 42" $88.64 No Bid $88.70 $88.64 

HP Pipe 48" $120.46 No Bid $116.40 $120.46 

HP Pipe 60" $162.50 No Bid No Bid $162.50 


