
LAUDERDALE COUNTY BOARD OF SUPERVISORS – 2024 1ST 6-MONTHS TERM BID OPENING RESULTS  
TOTAL BIDS SUBMITTED: 2 

 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

ADDITIONAL MATERIALS: TOTAL BIDS SUBMITTED: 1 

 APAC 
JACKSON, MS 

VULCAN MATERIALS 

LAUREL, MS SIEVE 
SIZE 
Percent 
Passing by 
Weight 

Size ¾ inch 
and < 

Size ¾ inch 
and < 

Size ¾ 
inch and < 

Size ¾ inch 
and < 

Size No. 
610 

Size No. 
825 B 

 Price per 
Ton 

Price per 
Ton 

Price per 
Ton 

Price per 
Ton 

Price per 
Ton 

Price 
per Ton 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
$39.50 

 
$39.50 

BID NO: 3962 Gravel, Stone, Rip Rap,  
Ready-Mix Concrete 
 
Items for Bid 

APCAC 
 

JACKSON, MS 
FINAL BID 

VULCAN 
MATERIALS 
LAUREL, MS 

FINAL BID 

#1 GRAVEL - per Yard $21.00/TN Oversized No Bid 

#2 GRAVEL - per Yard $18.00/TN Washed No Bid 

CLAY GRAVEL (Cl.4, Gp B) - per Yard No Bid No Bid 

CLAY GRAVEL (Cl. 5, Gp B) - per Yard No Bid No Bid 

#4 STONE - per Ton No Bid $40.50 

#5 STONE - per Ton No Bid $40.50 

#6 STONE - per Ton No Bid $40.50 

#7 STONE - per Ton No Bid $41.50 

#57 STONE - per Ton No Bid $40.50 

#89 STONE - per Ton No Bid $41.50 

DRY RIP RAP: SIZE 100# - per Ton No Bid $50.50 

DRY RIP RAP: SIZE 200# - per Ton No Bid $50.50 

DRY RIP RAP: SIZE 300# - per Ton No Bid $50.50 

DRY RIP RAP: GABION (3x3x3) - per Ton No Bid $$50.50 
3X6 

CRUSHED LIMESTONE (Crusher Run) (#610) per Ton No Bid $39.50 

CRUSHED CONCRETE (Crusher Run)  
Meeting #610 Gradation 

No Bid No Bid 

CONCRETE, READY-MIXED, HAULED, FOB COUNTY….   

CLASS B (3500 PSI) - PRICED PER YARD No Bid No Bid 

CLASS C (3000 PSI) - PRICED PER YARD No Bid No Bid 

CLASS B WITH FIBER - PRICED PER YARD No Bid No Bid 

CLASS C WITH FIBER - PRICED PER YARD No Bid No Bid 

FOB PLANT LOCATION Columbus, MS Meridian, MS 


