LAUDERDALE COUNTY BOARD OF SUPERVISORS — 2024 2" 6-MONTHS TERM BID OPENING RESULTS - TOTAL BIDS SUBMITTED: 2

8D NO: 3984 HDPE G&OSUPPLY | SOUTHERN PIPE &
Corrugated Plastic Pipe ;

Diameter sizes: 12” - 36” SUPPLY
HDPE Corrugated Plastic TUPELO, M5 RICHLAND, M5
Pipe - Item for Bid FINAL BID FINAL BID
Corrugated Pipe 12" $7.17 $7.17
Corrugated Pipe 15" $9.45 $9.45
Corrugated Pipe 18" $13.85 $13.85
Corrugated Pipe 20" No Bid No Bid
Corrugated Pipe 24" $22.53 $22.53
Corrugated Pipe 30" $31.49 $31.49
Corrugated Pipe 36" $36.87 $36.87
Corr.Coupling 12" $9.66 $9.66
Corr.Coupling 15" $16.10 $16.10
Corr.Coupling 18" $27.42 $27.42
Corr.Coupling 20" No Bid No Bid
Corr.Coupling 24" $38.92 $38.92
Corr.Coupling 30" $89.92 $89.92
Corr.Coupling 36" $125.12 $125.12
Smooth Inter. Pipe 12" $7.17 $7.17
Smooth Inter. Pipe 15" $9.45 $9.45
Smooth Inter. Pipe 18" $13.85 $13.85
Smooth Inter. Pipe 20" No Bid No Bid
Smooth Inter. Pipe 24" $22.53 $22.53
Smooth Inter. Pipe 30" $31.49 $31.49
Smooth Inter. Pipe 36" $36.87 $36.87
Smooth Inter.Coupling 12" $9.66 $9.66
Smooth Inter.Coupling 15" $16.10 $16.10
Smooth Inter.Coupling 18" $27.42 $27.42
Smooth Inter.Coupling 20" No Bid No Bid
Smooth Inter.Coupling 24" $38.92 $38.92
Smooth Inter.Coupling 30" $89.92 $89.92
Smooth Inter.Coupling 36" $125.12 $125.12




LAUDERDALE COUNTY BOARD OF SUPERVISORS — 2024 2" 6-MONTHS TERM BID OPENING RESULTS - TOTAL BIDS SUBMITTED: 2

BID NO: 3984 PROPOSAL #2 G&OSUPPLY | SOUTHERN PIPE &

High Performance (HP)_ SUPPLY

;‘I’;‘r’:;:’;y:z’;is;“z’rm GP(;f,’es TUPELO, MS RICHLAND, MS
: FINAL BID FINAL BID

Item for Bid

HP Pipe 12" $11.41 $11.41

HP Pipe 15" $15.76 $15.76

HP Pipe 18" $21.20 $21.20

HP Pipe 24" $32.07 $32.07

HP Pipe 30" $48.91 $48.91

HP Pipe 36" $66.30 $66.30

HP Pipe 42" $82.61 $82.61

HP Pipe 48" $110.87 $110.87

HP Pipe 60" $152.17 $152.17




