
LAUDERDALE COUNTY BOARD OF SUPERVISORS – 2025 ANNUAL TERM BID OPENING RESULTS - TOTAL BIDS SUBMITTED: 5 
 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

BID NO: 4000 HDPE 
Corrugated Plastic Pipe ; 
Diameter sizes: 12” - 36” 
HDPE Corrugated Plastic 
Pipe  - Item for Bid 

 
SOUTHERN PIPE & 

SUPPLY 
RICHLAND, MS 

FINAL BID 
 

 
G & O SUPPLY 

 
TUPELO, MS 
FINAL BID 

 
EAGLE PIPE & 

SUPPLY 
JACKSON, MS 

FINAL BID 

  
CAVCO INC. 
BON AIR, AL 

BID NOT READ 
DOCUMENT 
NOT SIGNED 

 
J & G CULVERTS 

 
FAYETTE, AL 
FINAL BID 

Corrugated Pipe 12" $7.17 No Bid $7.17 N/A $7.03 

Corrugated Pipe 15" $9.45 No Bid $9.45 N/A $9.26 

Corrugated Pipe 18" $13.85 No Bid $13.85 N/A $13.57 

Corrugated Pipe 20" No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A No Bid 

Corrugated Pipe 24" $22.53 No Bid $22.53 N/A $22.08 

Corrugated Pipe 30" $31.49 No Bid $31.49 N/A $30.86 

Corrugated Pipe 36" $36.87 No Bid $36.87 N/A $36.13 

Corr.Coupling 12" $9.66 No Bid $9.66 N/A $9.66 

Corr.Coupling 15" $16.10 No Bid $16.10 N/A $16.10 

Corr.Coupling 18" $27.42 No Bid $27.42 N/A $27.42 

Corr.Coupling 20" No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A No Bid 

Corr.Coupling 24" $38.69 No Bid $38.69 N/A $38.92 

Corr.Coupling 30" $89.92 No Bid $89.92 N/A $89.92 

Corr.Coupling 36" $125.12 No Bid $125.12 N/A $125.12 

Smooth Inter. Pipe 12" $7.17 $7.17 $7.17 N/A $7.03 

Smooth Inter. Pipe 15" $9.45 $9.45 $9.45 N/A $9.26 

Smooth Inter. Pipe 18" $13.85 $13.85 $13.85 N/A $13.57 

Smooth Inter. Pipe 20" No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A No Bid 

Smooth Inter. Pipe 24" $22.53 $22.53 $22.53 N/A $22.08 

Smooth Inter. Pipe 30" $31.49 $31.49 $31.49 N/A $30.86 

Smooth Inter. Pipe 36" $36.87 $36.87 $36.87 N/A $36.13 

Smooth Inter.Coupling 12" $9.66 $9.66 $9.66 N/A $9.66 

Smooth Inter.Coupling 15" $16.10 $16.10 $16.10 N/A $16.10 

Smooth Inter.Coupling 18" $27.42 $27.42 $27.42 N/A $27.42 

Smooth Inter.Coupling 20" No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A No Bid 

Smooth Inter.Coupling 24" $38.69 $38.69 $38.69 N/A $38.92 

Smooth Inter.Coupling 30" $89.92 $89.92 $89.92 N/A $89.92 

Smooth Inter.Coupling 36" $125.12 $125.12 $125.12 N/A $125.12 



LAUDERDALE COUNTY BOARD OF SUPERVISORS – 2025 ANNUAL TERM BID OPENING RESULTS - TOTAL BIDS SUBMITTED: 5 
 
 

 

 

BID NO: 4000 PROPOSAL #2 
High Performance (HP) 
Polypropylene Storm Pipes 
Diameter sizes: 12” - 60”     
Item for Bid 

 
SOUTHERN PIPE & 

SUPPLY 
RICHLAND, MS 

FINAL BID 
 

 
G & O SUPPLY 

 
TUPELO, MS 

FINAL BID 

 
EAGLE PIPE & 

SUPPLY 
JACKSON, MS 

FINAL BID 

  
CAVCO INC. 
BON AIR, AL 

BID NOT READ 
DOCUMENT 
NOT SIGNED 

 
J & G CULVERTS 

 
FAYETTE, AL 
FINAL BID  

 

HP Pipe 12" $11.41 $11.41 $11.41 N/A $11.18 

HP Pipe 15" $15.76 $15.76 $15.76 N/A $15.44 

HP Pipe 18" $21.20 $21.20 $21.20 N/A $20.78 

HP Pipe 24" $32.07 $32.07 $32.07 N/A $31.43 

HP Pipe 30" $48.91 $48.91 $48.91 N/A $47.93 

HP Pipe 36" $66.30 $66.30 $66.30 N/A $64.97 

HP Pipe 42" $82.61 $82.61 $82.61 N/A $80.96 

HP Pipe 48" $110.87 $110.87 $110.87 N/A $108.65 

HP Pipe 60" $152.17 $152.17 $152.17 N/A $149.13 




